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After Walking 100 Km, Migrant's Wife Delivers
Baby; Child Dies
Bindia and her husband Jatin Ram, who are in their early 20s, had set out from Ludhiana last week for
their village in Bihar.
All India Press Trust of India Updated: May 24, 2020 02:51 am IST

Bindia married Ram two years ago and it was their �rst child (Representational)

Ambala: A migrant labourer's pregnant wife, who walked over 100 km from
Ludhiana in Punjab, delivered a girl child after reaching Ambala in Haryana but the
baby died shortly after birth.

Bindia and her husband Jatin Ram, who are in their early 20s, had set out from
Ludhiana last week for their village in Bihar. When the couple reached Ambala City
on Wednesday, the woman gave birth to a female child. However, the baby died
immediately after the birth.

The couple performed the last rites in Ambala City.

Bindia married Ram two years ago and it was their �rst child.

She had come to Ludhiana from Bihar last year with Ram, who worked as a
labourer in a factory.

After the coronavirus forced a lockdown most migrant workers began leaving for
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After the coronavirus forced a lockdown, most migrant workers began leaving for
their home towns. Some walked and others hired vehicles to reach Ambala and
Yamunanagar to board special trains.

Ram said he and his nine-month pregnant wife decided to walk to Ambala after
they did not get registration in special trains, possibly to save money for future
travel expenses.

Bindia was very weak as she did not get a proper diet required by a pregnant
woman, the husband said, adding they did not have enough money as he lost his
job during lockdown.

When they reached Ambala City, from Ludhiana, after walking more than 100 km,
Bindia started having labour pain and police helped Ram take her to the civil
hospital. She delivered the child but the baby did not survive.

An NGO at Ambala Cantonment has made arrangements for their stay and is
provided them food.

The NGO has assured the couple they would also make arrangements for their
safe travel in a Shramik Special train to Bihar.

(This story has not been edited by NDTV staff and is auto-generated from a
syndicated feed.)
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